DURHAM
COUNTY

INVITATION FOR BIDS

Medical Supplies for
Emergency Medical Services

IFB No. 24-008

Proposal Tabulation

October 19,2023, at 2:00 P.M., Eastern Time

SECTIONS
Proposers
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Airway Monitor CPAP & DVM EZ 10 IV IV Supplies Trauma
Mgmt. Supplies
Bound Tree Medical, $108,853.54 | $126,167.86 | NO BID NO BID $134,161.34 | $61,667.61 | $46,177.72
LLC
800-824-6
Henry Schein, Inc. $113,259.61 | $131,438.93 | $66,824.65 NO BID $137,227.72 | $145,094.69 | $52,356.00
800-845-3550
Life-Assist, Inc. $139,048.84 | $102,500.94 | $59,320.00 NO BID $149,689.99 | $65,948.18 $58,489.46
800-824-6016
Medline Industries, LP. | NO BID $428,671.00 | $108,900.00. | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

224-327-8212




