
 

Bid Tabulation 
Chemicals for Durham County Triangle Wastewater Treatment Plant (TWWTP) 

(IFB 18-030) 

Apri1 10, 2018 @ 2:00 P.M. 

 

 

 

 

Chemical 

Description 

 BIDDERS  

 

 

 

Amerochem 

Corp. 

 

 

Brenntag 

Southeast, 

Inc. 

 

 

 

C & S 

Chemicals 

 

 

 

GEO Specialty 

Chemicals 

 

 

 

Kemira Water 

Solutions, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

Polydyne, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

Solenis 

 

 

 

Southern 

Ionics, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

USALCO 

1. Sodium Aluminate No Bid    No Bid No Bid No Bid   

 

Cost Per Gallon 

  

$1.875/gal. 

 

$1.89/gal. 

 

$2.2245/gal. 

    

$1.72/Gal. 

 

$2.5543 

Annual Cost 

(~80,000 gallon/year) 

  

$150,000.00_ 

 

$151,200.00 

 

$177,960.00 

 

$ 
 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$137,600.00 

 

$204,344.00 

          

2. Methanol No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

Cost Per Gallon 

  

$1.90/gal. 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 
 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

Annual Cost 

(~60,000 gallon/year) 

  

$114,000.00 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 
 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

          

3. Sodium  Hypochlorite   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

Cost Per Gallon 

 

$0.702/gal. 
 

$.7760/gal. 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 
 

$ 

 

$ 
 

$ 
 

$ 

Annual Cost 

(~50,000 gallon/year) 
 

$35,000.00 

 

$38,800.00 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 
 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

4. Sodium Hydroxide     No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

Cost Per Gallon 

  

$2.7730 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

~15,000 gallon/year 

  

$41,595.00 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

 

$ 

5. Dewatering Polymer* 
~75,000 lbs. 

   GE Betz, Inc. – Novus –  

   CE2653 N2 

    

   Polydyne Clarifloc SE-133 

     

   Polydyne Clarifoc C-6256 

 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

$1.250/lb. 

$93,750.00 

$1.20/lb. 

$90,000.00 

Solenis 

Praestol 

K275 FLX 

$1.03/lb. 

$77,250.00 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

 

  

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

*Dewatering Polymer will be rebid. 


