
Caution:  Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Caution:  Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From: Rose, Ben
To: Inman, Kelly B.; Gordon, Janeen
Subject: FW: Update on Status of Emergency Rental Assistance Application
Date: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 4:15:08 PM
Attachments: ERAP Agreement UPDATED DUNS Jan 21 2021 Durham County.PDF

 
 
William B. Rose, Director
Durham County Social Services
414 East Main Street
Durham, NC 27701
Office (919) 560-8039
HIPAA/Confidentiality Notice: This email and its attachments may contain privileged and confidential information
and/or protected health information (PHI) by virtue of the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of
1996 (HIPAA) or Peer Review material pursuant to N.C.G.S. § 90-21.22A, intended solely for the use of individual or
entity to which it is addressed.  If you are not the recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this
message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution, printing or
copying of this email message and/or any attachments is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this transmission in
error, please permanently delete this email and any attachments and notify the sender immediately by telephone.
 
Aviso de confidencialidad HIPAA: Este correo electrónico y sus anexos pueden contener información privilegiada y
confidencial y / o información de salud protegida (PHI) en virtud de la Ley de Portabilidad y Responsabilidad del
Seguro Médico de 1996 (HIPAA), destinada únicamente al uso de una persona o entidad para a cuál se dirige. Si
usted no es el destinatario, se le notifica que cualquier revisión, diseminación, distribución, impresión o copia de
este mensaje de correo electrónico y / o cualquier archivo adjunto está estrictamente prohibido. Si ha recibido esta
transmisión por error, elimine permanentemente este correo electrónico y cualquier archivo adjunto y notifique al
remitente de inmediato por teléfono.
 
From: EmergencyRentalAssistance@treasury.gov <emergencyrentalassistance@treasury.gov> 
Sent: Monday, February 1, 2021 8:29 AM
To: Rose, Ben <wrose@dconc.gov>
Cc: caresitforms@treasury.gov
Subject: Update on Status of Emergency Rental Assistance Application
 

Thank you for submitting your data for Emergency Rental Assistance to the Treasury Department. Your application has been reviewed and
approved. You should expect to receive $1,244,759.40 over the following two business days. Please see attached for the executed
agreement.

The ERA Team

ERAApplications@treasury.gov
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